
Abstract
Advances in biotechnology during the past 
two decades have given us the ability to 
determine the complete genetic makeup of 
an individual and to monitor the activities 
of many genes and proteins in selected cell 
types from this individual.  At the same 
time, equally impressive advances were 
made in information technology that 
makes it feasible to create and maintain 
individual health records in an electronic 
manner. It is envisioned that the 
convergence of these two mega trends will 
provide the foundation for Personalized 
Medicine. The linkage of personal genetics / 
molecular / cellular data to the electronic 
health records will allow us to apply 
modern statistical modeling, learning and 
data mining techniques, to extract 
knowledge that will be crucial for the 
progress of personalized medicine. In this 
talk I will review the current status of this 
area and will discuss some of the challenges 
and opportunities in this exciting interface 
between Statistics and Medicine.
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